

**BID RESULTS RECORDED BELOW REPRESENT A TABULATION OF BIDS AS OPENED AND READ,  
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN EVALUATION OR ENDORSEMENT OF THE RESPONSIVENESS OF THE BIDS**



*Protecting Lake Michigan & Our Waterways.*

**North Shore Water  
Reclamation District**

**BID RESULTS**

**DATE:**  
**TIME:**

**4/7/2025**  
**10:00 a.m.**

**BID OPENING FOR: Bid No. 1448 - PROCESS CHEMICALS SUPPLY SERVICES**

Vendor	Projected Annual Use (in pounds)	Chemical/Delivery Type	5/15/25 - 4/30/26	5/1/26 - 4/30/27	5/1/27 - 4/30/28
			Total Delivered Unit Price Per lb.	Total Delivered Unit Price Per lb.	Total Delivered Unit Price Per lb.
ALEXANDER CHEMICAL CORPORATION	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	\$0.172	No Bid	No Bid
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	\$0.427	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	\$0.276	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	\$0.212	No Bid	No Bid
Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals		\$0.195	No Bid	No Bid	
	Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	\$0.179	No Bid	No Bid	
PVS TECHNOLOGIES, INC.	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	\$0.22	\$0.24	\$0.25
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
ROWELL CHEMICAL	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	\$0.154	\$0.161	\$0.171
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	\$0.13	\$0.16	\$0.19	

PENCO, INC.	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	\$0.305	No Bid	No Bid
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	0.3290	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	\$0.195	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	\$0.195	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals	\$0.195	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	\$0.199	\$0.209	\$0.228
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
VIKING CHEMICAL COMPANY	2,160,000	Sodium Hypochlorite / Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	1,075,000	Ferric Chloride / Bulk	\$0.266	No Bid	No Bid
	30,000	Sodium Bisulfite/ Bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	200,000	Sodium Hydroxide, 500-1,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 1,000-2,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 2,001-3,000 gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Sodium Hydroxide, 3,001+ gals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid